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ANNUAL GOVERNANCE STATEMENT 
 

Purpose of this Statement 

The purpose of the Annual Governance Statement is to assess and demonstrate that there is a sound 
system of corporate governance throughout the organisation. 

Scope of responsibility 

Tonbridge & Malling Borough Council is responsible for ensuring that its business is conducted in 
accordance with the law and proper standards covering local authority activities, and that public 
money is safeguarded and properly accounted for, and used economically, efficiently and effectively.  
The Council also has a duty under the Local Government Act 1999 to make arrangements to secure 
continuous improvement in the way in which its functions are carried out, having regard to a 
combination of economy, efficiency and effectiveness. 

In discharging this overall responsibility, the Council is responsible for putting in place proper 
arrangements for the governance of its affairs, facilitating the effective exercise of its functions, and 
which includes arrangements for the management of risk. 

The Council has approved and adopted a Local Code of Corporate Governance which has been 
developed in consideration of the principles of the CIPFA/SOLACE Framework Delivering Good 
Governance in Local Government.  A copy of the authority’s Code can be obtained from the Legal 
team.  This statement explains how the Council has complied with the Code and also meets the 
requirements of the Accounts and Audit (England) Regulations which requires all relevant bodies to 
prepare an Annual Governance Statement. 

The purpose of the governance framework 

The governance framework comprises the systems and processes, culture and values by which the 
authority is directed and controlled and its activities through which it accounts to, engages with and 
leads its communities.  It enables the authority to monitor the achievement of its strategic objectives 
and to consider whether those objectives have led to the delivery of appropriate services and value 
for money. 

The system of internal control is a significant part of that framework and is designed to manage risk to 
a reasonable level.  It cannot eliminate all risk of failure to achieve policies, aims and objectives and 
can, therefore, only provide reasonable and not absolute assurance of effectiveness.  The system of 
internal control is based on an ongoing process designed to identify and prioritise the risks to the 
achievement of the Council’s policies, aims and objectives, to evaluate the likelihood and potential 
impact of those risks being realised, and to manage them efficiently, effectively and economically. 

The governance framework has been in place at Tonbridge & Malling Borough Council for the year 
ended 31 March 2024 and up to the date of approval of this statement. 

The governance framework 

The Council’s Local Code of Corporate Governance sets out the arrangements in place to govern the 
Council’s activities under seven main headings. 

Behaving with integrity, demonstrating strong commitment to ethical values, and respecting the rule of 
law 

Standards of conduct among Members and Officers are governed through the Council’s Members’ 
Code of Conduct and Officer Code of Conduct.  Effective communication between Members and 
Officers is ensured through the Protocol on Member/Officer Relations documented within the 
Constitution.  Arrangements are in place ensuring both Members and Officers declare any interests 
that may impact on the Council’s decision making process.  Such interests are recorded on a register 
which is maintained and monitored by the Monitoring Officer and the register of Members’ Interests 
published on the Council’s website. 

The Members’ Code of Conduct is based around ethical behaviour and requires objective and 
impartial decision making.  The Code is communicated to all new Members on induction.  Upholding 
standards of Member conduct is the responsibility of the Joint Standards Committee.  The Committee 
are also responsible for ensuring Members receive suitable induction and ongoing training and 
support in respect of ethical standards. 
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All staff are required to read and understand the Officer Code of Conduct available through the 
Council’s intranet and are bound by it as detailed in employee contracts.  The Council has an 
appraisal scheme in place for all staff that seeks to ensure staff achieve agreed levels of performance 
and the monitoring and management of performance is the responsibility of line managers.  In 
addition the Council’s statutory Officers are subject to Continuing Professional Development through 
their respective Professional Organisations. 

The Council’s duty to ensure that all activities undertaken are in accordance with the law is 
discharged in part by the Council’s Constitution including its Financial Procedure Rules and Contracts 
Procedure Rules and supported by strategies/polices relevant to Council activities that are made 
available to staff and the public via the Council’s intranet and internet sites respectively.  Where it is 
appropriate strategies/policies are allocated to a lead Officer who is responsible for their periodic 
review and updating. 

Ensuring openness and comprehensive stakeholder engagement 

The decision-making framework of the Council is set out in the Constitution including statutory 
functions and the scheme of delegation of responsibilities.  The Constitution is kept under review by 
the Monitoring Officer and Management Team with any proposed changes presented to the Council 
for adoption where not delegated to the Monitoring Officer.  Notices of Key Decisions are published in 
advance via the Council’s website.  All Member meetings held by the Council are open to the public 
and live streamed on You Tube, unless the items being discussed are considered to be confidential 
(Executive meetings) or otherwise exempt under the Local Government Act 1972 (all meetings); these 
will include staffing and legal matters and those of a contractual nature. 

The Council’s Constitution details the roles and responsibilities that are delegated to Members and 
Officers and specifies which decisions may be made by individuals and which are reserved for 
Committee, Cabinet or Council.  The Constitution includes the Council’s Financial and Contracts 
Procedure Rules setting out the Council’s standing orders and financial regulations.  The specific 
roles and responsibilities of Officers are set out through the scheme of delegation including the 
specific responsibilities of the Chief Executive (as Head of Paid Service), the Section 151 Officer and 
the Monitoring Officer ensuring effective arrangements are in place for the discharge of these 
functions. 

The Overview and Scrutiny Committee is responsible for reviewing and scrutinising the decisions 
made by and performance of the Cabinet and/or Committees and Council Officers.  Decisions made 
by Cabinet or a Cabinet Member can be subjected to scrutiny via a call-in procedure allowing 
challenge within five working days of the decision being taken. In addition to the Overview an Scrutiny 
Committee, the Council has also has three Scrutiny Select Committees which have the power to 
investigate any matters they consider relevant to their work area, and to make recommendations to 
the Council, the executive or any committee of the Council as they see fit. 

The Council has established arrangements to communicate and consult with stakeholders on the 
Council’s work and key policy changes and this consultation allows the development of strategic 
priorities and the Corporate Strategy.  In addition, the Council uses its complaints procedure to 
understand where services can be improved. 

Defining outcomes in terms of sustainable economic, social and environmental benefits 

The Council’s current Corporate Strategy was approved by Full Council in the Summer of 2023. 

The strategy covers the period 2023 to 2027 and sets out our vision: “To be an innovative and 
forward-thinking council, that leads the people and businesses of the borough towards a vibrant, 
prosperous and sustainable future.” 

The Council’s Medium Term Financial Strategy (MTFS) covers both revenue and capital budgets, and 
it is this strategy that underpins the budget setting process for the forthcoming year and over the 
strategy period.  The aim of the MTFS is to give us a realistic and sustainable plan that reflects the 
Council’s priorities and takes us into the future.  Alongside the MTFS sits a Savings and 
Transformation Strategy.  Its purpose, to provide structure, focus and direction in addressing the 
significant financial challenge that lies ahead. 

Value for money considerations are set out in all Member reports where relevant.  The social impact 
of decisions is considered throughout the decision making process, including the carrying out of an 
Equalities Impact Assessment.  Where relevant, policies are subject to a Strategic Environmental 
Impact Assessment prior to adoption. 
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Determining the interventions necessary to optimise the achievement of the intended outcomes 

Decision making mechanisms are set out in detail in the Council’s Constitution.  Whether a decision is 
at Council, Cabinet or Committee level it is informed by a report encompassing advice from relevant 
services across the Council.  Where relevant, alternative options are provided within Member reports, 
with an assessment of the advantages and disadvantages of those options. 

The Corporate Strategy  provides a reference point for the actions we take to maintain and improve 
the services which are most important to the local community whilst taking into account a much 
reduced level of funding.  The delivery of the Corporate Strategy and addendum is supported by 
operational plans prepared by individual services, which in turn are fed down to team and individual 
objectives through performance management arrangements. 

Performance of the Council and its partners in achieving its objectives is monitored and measured by 
services and their respective Service Management Teams and subsequently Members.  Individual 
services are accountable to the Corporate Management Team for operational performance monitoring 
and measurement and are responsible for taking action to correct any adverse performance, in the 
first instance, as appropriate. 

Developing the entity’s capacity, including the capability of its leadership and the individuals within it 

The Council works towards improving value for money through exploration of innovative ways of 
working including IT related solutions; potential for joint working and shared services; robust 
budgeting and financial monitoring arrangements including detailed reviews of budgets and potential 
savings opportunities and the work of internal and external audit. 

The Council has a training programme for Members and holds regular training sessions (both on a 
programmed and ad hoc basis) on a variety of topics including induction training for all new Members 
and Committee specific training, e.g. Audit Committee, Overview and Scrutiny Committee. 

The Council has an extensive training programme for officers including mandatory and voluntary 
training.  Staff have access to appropriate induction training, and ongoing training (both on a 
programmed and ad-hoc basis) relevant to their roles.  The annual appraisal process reviews staff 
performance and also identifies training needs. 

Managing risks and performance through robust internal control and strong public financial 
management 

The core functions of an audit committee as defined by CIPFA’s Audit Committees: Practical 
Guidance for Local Authorities is fulfilled by the Council’s Audit Committee.  The Council’s 
Constitution sets out the responsibility of the Audit Committee to provide independent assurance of 
the adequacy of the risk management framework and associated control environment.  To do so, the 
Audit Committee has adopted a Risk Management Strategy that sets out the roles of Members and 
Officers in the identification and minimisation of risk. 

Risk management practices are embedded within the organisation through the annual service and 
strategic planning processes, which is used to develop the Council’s vision and objectives.  This 
ensures that risks to the achievement of the Council’s objectives are identified and managed 
appropriately.  Risks identified are scored on the basis of their likelihood and impact and existing 
controls and required actions to further mitigate risks are captured in risk registers and a risk 
management escalation process in place.  The framework sets out the responsibility of Officers 
leading on areas with partnership arrangements to ensure that the partner has an adequate risk 
management strategy and sufficient insurance cover to protect the interests of the Council. 

Specific issues that required continuing corporate ownership, action and monitoring in 2023/24 and 
identified several high risk areas on the Strategic Risk Register, these risks were monitored reviewed 
by the Corporate Management Team and reported to the Audit Committee. 

The Covid-19 pandemic and subsequent inflationary pressures have had a profound impact across 
service areas, businesses and the wider community and continue to do so.  We will not know the full 
extent of the impact for some time.  In looking forward it is assumed that the reductions in income and 
increased costs seen as a result of the pandemic in large part will return to pre Covid-19 levels in the 
short to medium term.  The extent and speed of the recovery will need to be closely monitored and to 
take corrective action if this is proved not to be the case. 

The Council’s standard report template requires Members and Officers to carry out a risk assessment 
of the action recommended in the report ensuring risk is considered in all decision-making of the 






